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UNIVERSITY OF.
South Carolina

Posting Date: October 6, 2022

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

This is a notice of intent to award a contract and becomes the official statement of award effective 8:00 AM,
October 18, 2022, unless otherwise suspended or canceled. Contractor should not perform work on or incur any
costs associated with the contract prior to the effective date of the contract. The University assumes no liability
for any expenses incurred prior to the effective date of the contract and issuance of a purchase order.

Bidder’s right to protest as listed in section 11-35-4210 in the South Carolina Consolidated Procurement Code
applies to this award. Protest to be filed with:

(a) by email to protest-itmo@itmo.sc.gov , or
(b) by post or delivery to 1201 Main Street, Suite 601, Columbia, SC 29201

Solicitation Number: USC-FPB-3641-SG

Issue Date: July 5, 2020

Deadline for Receipt of Offers (initial): July 27,2020 @ 11:00 AM

Description: Program Management Consulting Services for the University

of South Carolina

Awarded to: Inner Circle Solutions, LLC
342 Woodland Path
Dallas, GA 30132

Initial Contract Term: October 18, 2022 through September 24, 2023
Maximum Contract Term: October 18, 2022 through September 24, 2023
Estimated Potential Value of Contract: $3,000,000.00

Lana Widener
Procurement Manager

Purchasing Department, 1600 Hampton Street, Suite 606, Columbia, SC 29208
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USC-FPB-3641-SG Program Services Awards

PROGRAM MANAGEMENT AWARDS LIST - Effective Through September 24, 2023

Contractor

Maximum Hourly Rate for Bid . | UsC-FPB-3641-SG-

s

Contract Number Sr. VP | Regional [Sr. Project| Project |Asst.Project Project Workflow | Clerical
Email Address VP Manager | Manager | Manager Analyst Specialist

$365.00 | $280.00 | $245.00 [ $210.00 | S 180.00 | S 170.00 | $ 150.00

45.00 |Awarded

Brailsford & Dunlavey bnoyes@bdconnect.com USC-FPB-3641-SG-01 S 365.00 | S 280.00 | $ 245.00| $ 210.00| S 180.00 | S 170.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 45.00 9/15/2020
Howell Strategies, LLC - 0000042908 Ichowelliv@gmail.com USC-FPB-3641-SG-02 S 87.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9/1/2020
John H. Lumpkin, Jr. USC-FPB-3641-SG-03 No Bid No Bid S 245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9/1/2020
Kennedy & Company - 0000007132 USC-FPB-3641-SG-04 S 350.00 | S 275.00 | No Award | No Award | No Award No Award S 150.00 | S 45.00 9/1/2020
Kennedy & Company - 0000007133 USC-FPB-3641-SG-04 - - S 245.00 [ S 210.00| S 180.00 | S 170.00 - - 12/1/2020
LLE Construction Group USC-FPB-3641-SG-05 S 365.00 | S 280.00 | $ 245.00| $ 210.00| $ 180.00 | S 170.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 45.00 9/1/2020
McGuire Woods Consulting - 0000004030 |bboan@mwcllc.com USC-FPB-3641-SG-06 S 365.00 | S 280.00 No Bid No Bid S 180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9/1/2020
Rieth Jones Advisors - 0000038525 USC-FPB-3641-SG-07 S 365.00 | S 280.00 | $ 245.00 | $ 210.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9/1/2020
Center for Teacher Quality - 0000030827 accountsprocessing@teachingguality.org |USC-FPB-3641-SG-08 S 187.50 No Bid S 187.50 | S 187.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12/3/2020
Optimization Corp 0000033282 USC-FPB-3641-SG-09 $ 250.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 130.00 | S 120.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 30.00 12/3/2020
Kennedy & Company - 0000007133 USC-FPB-3641-SG-10 X X S 245.00 [ S 210.00| S 180.00 | S 170.00 X X 12/3/2020
Omme-Salma Rahemtullah - 0000045425 USC-FPB-3641-SG-11 X X X S 54.00 X X X X 3/16/2021
g20, LLC USC-FPB-3641-SG-12 S 325.00 | S 265.00 | $ 235.00| $ 200.00 | $ 175.00 | S 165.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 45.00 3/16/2021
Cozen O'Conner Igomez@cozen.com USC-FPB-3641-SG-13 S 365.00| $ 280.00| S 245.00| $ 210.00( $ 180.00 X X X 4/7/2021
Payfactors USC-FPB-3641-SG-14 S 350.00 | S 250.00 | S 225.00 | $ 200.00 | S 175.00 | S 150.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 40.00 4/19/2021
BRBS World, LLC USC-FPB-3641-SG-15 $ 350.00 | $ 275.00| $ 225.00| $ 200.00 | $ 175.00 | S 165.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 45.00 4/19/2021
R-Research Ltd - 0000046161 USC-FPB-3641-SG-16 S 112.00| S 100.00| $ 87.00| $ 65.00]| $ 25.00 | S 65.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 10.00 5/7/2021
Cynthia H. Watson - 0000045723 USC-FPB-3641-SG-17 No Bid No Bid No Bid S 26.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5/7/2021
Kantar (TNS RMS East Africa Limited in Kenya) USC-FPB-3641-SG-18 S 280.00 | $ 210.00| $ 180.00| $ 170.00 | $ 150.00 | S 80.00 | S 70.00 [ S 28.00 5/27/2021
Kara Lea Ferguson Davis USC-FPB-3641-SG-19 $ 300.00 (| $ 225.00| $ 225.00| S 210.00| S 180.00 | S 170.00 | S 125.00 | S 45.00 12/12/2021
1600ver90 USC-FPB-3641-SG-20 $ 195.00 [ S 195.00 [ $ 195.00 | $ 195.00 No Award No Award No Award No Award 12/12/2021
Sightlines, LLC legal@gordian.com USC-FPB-3641-SG-21 S 325.00| $ 275.00| $ 245.00 | S 200.00 No Bid S 150.00 No Bid S 40.00 12/12/2021
EED Advisory Limited USC-FPB-3641-SG-22 S 150.00 | $ 100.00 | S 90.00| S 85.00( S 80.00 | S 70.00 | $ 65.00 [ S 30.00 2/21/2022
PropPublic Solutions, LLC USC-FPB-3641-SG-23 No Bid No Bid No Bid S 50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4/25/2022
Institute of International Education, Inc. jvisasponsorship @iie.org USC-FPB-3641-SG-24 $ 353.00 No Bid S 237.00 | $ 200.00 No Bid S 169.00 | $ 122.00 No Bid 9/29/2022
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Contract Number Regional |Sr. Project| Project |Asst. Project Project Workflow | Clerical

Contractor Email Address VP Manager | Manager | Manager Analyst Specialist
Inner Circle Solutions matt@ linnercircle.com USC-FPB-3641-5G-25 S 365.00 | S 280.00 | $ 245.00| $ 210.00| S 180.00 | S 170.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 45.00 10/18/2022
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